
CATS Final Confirmation 
 October 5-6, 2024 USDAA 

  

  

  

Miscellaneous 

We’ve added MISC as the first class on Saturday. It will begin at 8:00 immediately following the 
briefing. First titling class of the day will walk after Miscellaneous is done and the course is 
converted. Misc run cost is $10. Simply sign up when you arrive and leave $10.00 in the provided 
envelope.  Get your training in! 

  

Mulligans 

Mulligans are offered for all classes. Just write your name & height on the bottom of the Gate Sheet 
when you exit BEFORE THE CLASS IS OVER. $5.00 per mulligan run. 

  

Volunteers 

We appreciate our volunteers. Please sign up to help and you will receive a chance at our raffle for 
CATS Coupons placed in your account at MyDogEntry. Lynn Thibodeau will be our volunteer 
coordinator. 

  

Food Vendor 

CATS has executive pastry chef and award-winning baker Louise food vending both days. She will 
arrive early ready to make breakfast sandwiches. Bring your own coffee and beverages. Lunch 
menu is sandwiches (egg salad, tuna salad, and chicken salad). Lots of pastries and homemade 
cookies. Louise is also offering meals to go in easy to heat aluminum bread pans. Cash only please 
at the food table. 

Take & Bake Pre-Orders 

• Shepherd’s Pie 

• Meatloaf 
• Lasagna meatless or meat (hamburg w Italian sausage) 

Personal Size (1 ½ servings) $10 

Medium Size (2 ½ servings) $20 

PM Chris Frado Wentworth to pre-order. Cash apps just fine or bring payment to trial. 

I recommend Louise’s meals to go. LOVE LOVE LOVE her lasagna & almond sticks. 

  

Vendors for Canine Bodywork & Photography 



Please support our vendors. They enhance our trial and contribute gift certificates to the Worker 
Raffle. 

  

• Donna Kelliher Photography will be photographing our trial. See Donna to arrange special pics. 
Link to proofs sent out afterwards. Thank you, Donna. You capture our dogs skills and let their 
personalities shine through. 

  

• Nikki Gammans of Pro Canine Bodywork & Conditioning will be available for last minute tune ups 
and post-run trigger point massages. Her goal is enhancing your working or sporting canine’s 
performance. Ask Nikki about her experiences at Heathrow Airport with the Detector Dog Unit or her 
time in Abu Dhabi trapping strays. Nikki is a certified canine handler with New England K9 Search 
and Rescue. 

  

  

Saturday and Sunday 

  

• Measuring and check in 7:15 - 7:45 

• General briefing will be at 7:45 followed by Misc on Sat and Sun walk thrus. 
• First dog on line 3 minutes after walk. 

  

Walk-thrus & Worker Break for Masters/P3 Classes 

Walk-thrus will be 7 minutes long. Please pay special attention to the running order.  

There will be three (3) minutes after the walk thru before 1st dog is on line. 

When the trial is small we break Masters/P3 classes in half and there will be a 5-minute worker 
break to allow the workers to potty and get their dogs. 

  

Keep Things Moving 

To help speed it along, we ask that you listen to the judges briefing and being on line when asked to 
do so. This means leashes off and kisses done. 

  

Run Order on MyDogEntry 

==>Run orders are posted on {trial-link}  

  

Maps on MyDogEntry 

==>Maps will be available for all competitors through two methods: Maps will be posted on site for 
competitors to view and photograph. Maps will also be posted on {trial-link} Competitors may choose 
to also order physical copies of maps for $5 a day. We will not be printing individual copies of maps 



for competitors unless that competitor pre orders maps. If you choose to order maps, they will be 
available in the morning prior to walkthroughs  for pick up each day. 

  

 Dogs On Leash at All Times except…. 

==> Dogs must be on leash or crated unless in the ring or when at the warm up jump. Competitors 
are RESPONSIBLE for the behavior of their children and/or dogs and the dogs or children in their 
care. Please DO NOT tie your dogs out and/or leave them unattended at ANY time for ANY reason! 

  

Poop PICK IT UP 

==> Please pick up your dog's poop (or any other you may see); trash containers will be provided for 
disposal. Anyone who does not pick up after their dog will be asked to leave. No refund, no 
exceptions! 

  

NO Moving in Masters/P3 Snooker unless….  

==> Those dogs entered in Masters/PIII Snooker cannot be moved in the running order. The only 
exception to this USDAA rule is if you are running more than one dog and the dogs are within 10 
dogs of each other in the running order. You may only move UP in the running order. 

  

 


